From: H: Matthew

To: Kristie Prady-Diaz

Cc: i I

Subject: [From Outside] RE: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

Date: Friday, April 22, 2022 9:21:52 AM

Attachments: Alvord Maintenance history.pdf

CAUTION: This email origi d from ide your organizati Exercise ion when ing attach or clicking links, especially from unknown senders.
Kristie,

Let me know if you need any other info, but you guys have two trucks signed up for planned maintenance that get done four times a year. Attached is the usage
summary for what you guys spent last year as well, | gave a general break down of that at the bottom. Our labor rate for 2022 repairs is $180, and your planned
maintenance rates are fixed at the rate below. Let me know if you have any questions.

Planned Maintenance R:
Cost per
Customer Address Frequency | Model Serial Number Service Cost per year
Alvord Unified School 7377 Jurupa Ave Riverside $
District CA 3 months 40GPW 7A216213 115.00 $ 460.00
$
3 months SC4020-30 9A112182 135.00 S 540.00
S 1,000.00

Customer
Alvord Unified School 7377 Jurupa Ave Riverside 40GPW 7A216213 S 445.00
District CA SC4020-
30 9A112182 $ 525.00
18-85-17
(Forklift
battery) 21442242 | $ 2,089.04
S 3,059.04
Crown Hourly labor rate
2022 $ 180.00
Matt Happ

Field Service Manager
Crown Lift Trucks

4250 E. Greystone Drive
Ontario, CA 91761
Phone 909 923 8357
Cell- 951-453-6399
crown.com

From: Kristie Prady-Diaz <kristie.prady-diaz@alvordschools.org>
Sent: Friday, April 22,2022 8:12 AM

To: Happ, Matthew <Matthew.Happ@Crown.com>

Cc: Eric Holliday <eric.holliday@alvordschools.org>

Subject: RE: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Crown. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

It would be both areas — but only for CNS

Thank you,

Kristie Prady-Diaz

Assistant to the Director, Child Nutrition Services
7377 Jurupa Ave, Riverside, CA 92504

Phone: 951-509-6200 Fax: 951-351-9269

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE: This communication and any accompanying document(s) are privileged and
confidential, and are intended for the sole use of the addressee(s). If you have received this transmission in error,
you are advised that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or the taking of any action in reliance upon it is strictly
prohibited. If you received this communication in error, please return the message via email reply and immediately
delete it from your system.
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@

Ontario

Date Range: 3/31/2021 Thru 4/1/2022

Usage Summary Report

Alvord Unified School District
Customer Number: 234336
7377 Jurupa Ave

Riverside, CA 92504

Tel 909-351-9209

Serial Number: 21442242
403 8/13/2021 150686044
1007R4
X099 NO X-CODE
Signed By
403 1/7/2022 150718151
4005E
X002 OPERATOR ERROR
Signed By
-

Model:  18-85-17

0 4.9 0.0 428.01 0.00 0.00 0.00

Removed, Tested and Replaced ell replacement

Arrived at the location, checked in with the contact, located the battery with a bad
cell, moved the truck outside to a safe hot work area, verified the dead cell,
prepped the cell with moly and a cell separator to loosen the cell casing, cell
casing is heavily corroded, prepped and drilled out intercell connectors, cleaned my
work area, when extracting the cell the top tore due to corrosion, had to travel to
get a Mo clamp from another tech, returned to the customer, tried to extract the
cell when doing this the internal lead plates came out but the casing was still stuck
in the battery, asked the contact to use the stand up truck to extract the case he
asked me to wait 30-40mins until they finished unloading pallets, myself and
another tech used the reach truck to extract the casing, cleaned and vacuum the
corrosion for the new cell, installed the new cell, prepped and cleaned original
intercell connectors, welded original intercell connectors and verified they are
secure, cleaned my work area, moved the both trucks back inside, above repairs
tested and verified return battery to service, informed the contact.

No X-Code

Signed by Kristie Prady Diaz
0 3.5 0.0 273.38 0.00 0.00 247.50

Evaluated Battery

Arrived at location, located unit, moved to safe work area, bdi 55%, static voltage
37.36v. All cells range from 2.05-2.09v/ SG all cells low on water with exception of
cell #3 2.14v/SG 1275 (new cell) installed 2021. Due to non watering Battery
causes Battery to discharge very quickly, causes Battery cells to short out and
minimizes potential DC output. Visually inspecting watering kit found multiple
injectors broken, recommended to replace to keep their watering system
operational. Appoved. removed old watering system, neutralize battery, cleaned
and wiped down battery top, installed new injectors, cut hose to size, installed into
injectors, installed Male coupler, secured kit down with zip ties, topped off battery,
above all repairs tested and returned to service.

Operator Error

Signed by Allison

810.15

330.00

0.00

0.00

8.4 0.0 701.39 0.00 0.00 247.50

Run Date: 4/22/2022

1,140.15

0.00
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2,089.04





(’\ Usage Summary Report

Ontario

Date Range: 3/31/2021 Thru 4/1/2022

Invoice No. Reference Qty Part# Description Selling Price
150686044 W712090-1 1 291031-CW 085-17 Cell 420.68
150686044 W712090-1 1 300417-001 Lead Stick-12"/1# 7.33
150718151 W737669-1 1 300220-018 36V Standard Float Kit 273.38
701.39
Serial Number: 7A216213 Model: 40GPW
406 5/27/2021 150670057 0 0.0 1.5 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 110.00 110.00
PME3 QUARTERLY
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Made contact with the customer, located work area provided, located unit and
moved to work area, debris in load wheels, removed, left metal swing plate worn,
adjusted, cleaned up unit and returned to service
Checklist Results Checklist Note(s): Walkie Trucks, CRW 7A216213
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Inspect for Tape, String, etc. Around Drive Axle, Repair, Debris in load wheels
MAST ASSEMBLY,
Wear or Damage, Repair, Left swing bar worn
Signed By Signed by Sam
406 8/8/2021 150684897 0 0.0 1.2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 110.00 110.00
PME3 QUARTERLY Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Located unit and moved to work area provided, serviced unit, load wheels are
flatspotting, cleaned up unit and returned to customer
Checklist Results Checklist Note(s): Walkie Trucks, CRW 7A216213
Checklist Note(s): WP 2000/WP 2300/WP 3000 Series, CRW 7A216213
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
RH Load Wheel, Repair, Flatspotted
LH Load Wheel, Repair, Flatspotted
Signed By Signed by James
406 11/19/2021 150708173 0 0.0 1.2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 110.00 110.00
PME3 QUARTERLY Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Located unit and moved to work area provided, serviced unit, multiple labels worn
or damaged, cleaned up unit and returned to customer
@ Page 2 of 4

Run Date: 4/22/2022





@

Ontario

Date Range: 3/31/2021 Thru 4/1/2022
Checklist Results

Usage Summary Report

Checklist Note(s): WP 2000/WP 2300/WP 3000 Series, CRW 7A216213

VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
Drive Tire & Lug Bolts, Repair, Tire worn
Safety Decals & Capacity Plates in Place, Repair, Multiple labels worn or

damaged
Signed By Signed by James
406 2/23/2022 150729094 0 0.0 1.6 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 115.00 115.00
PME3 QUARTERLY Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Arrived at customer and gained access to building, located unit and moved to work
area provided, serviced unit, lift ram started to weep, load and drive tires worn,
multiple labels worn or damaged, cleaned up unit and returned to customer
Checklist Results Checklist Note(s): WP 2000/WP 2300/WP 3000 Series, CRW 7A216213
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
Drive Tire & Lug Bolts, Repair, Worn
RH Load Wheel, Repair, Worn
LH Load Wheel, Repair, Worn
Safety Decals & Capacity Plates in Place, Repair, Multiple labels worn or
damaged
HYDRAULIC SYSTEM,
Leaks-Cylinder, etc., Repair, Ram starting to weep
Signed By Signed by Jessica
0.0 55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 445.00 445.00
Serial Number: 9A112182 Model:  SC4020-30
406 5/27/2021 150670059 12696 0.0 1.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 130.00 130.00
PME3 QUARTERLY
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Located unit and moved to work area, left drive tire has chunks missing on it, side
shift plates need adjusted, tilt column loose, some panlels are cracked, cleaned
up unit and returned to service
Checklist Results Checklist Note(s): SC4000 Series, CRW 9A112182
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
Drive Tire LH, Repair, Chunking
CONTACTOR PANEL & POWER CONTACTORS,
Pump Tip Condition, Repair, Pitted
Line Tip Condition, Repair, Pitted
Signed By Signed by Sam
406 8/8/2021 150684896 12698 0.0 1.5 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 130.00 130.00
c Run Date: 4/22/2022 Page 3 of 4
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Ontario

Date Range: 3/31/2021 Thru 4/1/2022

PME3

406
PME3

406
PME3

QUARTERLY

Checklist Results

Signed By
11/19/2021

QUARTERLY

Checklist Results

Signed By
2/23/2022

QUARTERLY

Checklist Results

Signed By

150708172

150729095

Usage Summary Report

Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit

Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit

Gained access to building and located unit, moved to work area provided,
serviced unit , dashboard cracked, steering column little loose at tilt lock, cleaned
up unit and returned to customer

Checklist Note(s): SC4000 Series, CRW 9A112182
Signed by James

12714 0.0 1.9 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 130.00
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Gained access to building and located unit, spoke with customer if any concerns,
moved to work area provided, serviced unit, multiple scratches on unit, multiple
labels worn, drive tires worn, cleaned up unit and returned to customer
Checklist Note(s): SC4000 Series, CRW 9A112182
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
Drive Tire LH, Repair, Worn
Drive Tire RH, Repair, Worn
Safety Decals & Capacity Plates in Place, Repair, Multiple labels worn
Signed by James
12721 0.0 0.8 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 135.00
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Planned Maintenance for Electric Unit
Located unit and moved to work area provided, serviced unit, tilt column not
working, checked out, lower mounting pin broken, multiple labels worn or
damaged, drive tires worn , steering column damaged, cleaned up and returned to
customer
Checklist Note(s): SC4000 Series, CRW 9A112182
VISUAL INSPECTION,
Tire & Wheel Condition
Drive Tire LH, Repair, Worn
Drive Tire RH, Repair, Worn
Safety Decals & Capacity Plates in Place, Repair, Multiple labels worn or
damaged
Signed by Jessica
0.0 5.2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 525.00
Labor PM Part Freight Misc Total Travel Labor PM Total
Hours Hours Total Total Total Total
Totals: 8 1 701 0 0 248 1,140 970
Run Date: 4/22/2022 Page 4 of 4

130.00

135.00

525.00

Total

(excluding
tax)

3,059






From: Happ, Matthew [mailto:Matthew.Happ@Crown.com]
Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 8:09 AM

To: Kristie Prady-Diaz <kristie.prady-diaz@alvordschools.org>
Cc: Eric Holliday <eric.holliday@alvordschools.org>

Subject: [From Outside] RE: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

CAUTION: This email origi

d from ide your organizati Exercise tion when ing at or clicking links, especially from unknown senders.

Good morning Kristie,

| just wanted to check with you on this, are you looking for our labor rate and PM prices for your equipment, or do you need a estimated maintenance cost based
on last year? Also we service two Alvord locations, do you need this for both or just one location.

7377 Jurupa Ave Riverside CA 92504
10365 Keller Ave Riverside CA 92505

Matt Happ

Field Service Manager
Crown Lift Trucks

4250 E. Greystone Drive
Ontario, CA 91761
Phone 909 923 8357
Cell- 951-453-6399
crown.com

From: Robles, Chris <Chris.Robl rown.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 10:25 AM

To: Happ, Matthew <Matthew.Happ@Crown.com>
Subject: FW: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

Matt,
| believe you handle the Alvord Unified School district?

Christopher Robles | Service Manager
Crown Lift Trucks | 4250 E. Greystone Drive, Ontario, Ca. 91761
Cell 909-376-6806 | Office 909-923-8357 | www.crown.com

From: Kyle Bissell <kyle.bissell@crown.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 10:18 AM

To: Kristie Prady-Diaz <kristie.prady-diaz@alvordschools.org>

Cc: Eric Holliday <eric.holliday@alvordschools.org>; Robles, Chris <Chris.Robles@Crown.com>
Subject: RE: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

Kristie,
I’'m attaching Chris Robles to this email. He should be able to handle your inquiry about the prices. | only handle the Certificate of Insurance for Alvord.

Thank you

Kyle Bissell

Service Customer Care Representative
Ontario, CA
Ph: (909) 923-8357 ext. 65859 | kyle.bissell@crown.com

From: Kristie Prady-Diaz <kristie.prady-diaz@alvordschools.org>
Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 9:38 AM
To: Kyle Bissell <kyle.bissell@crown.com>

Cc: Eric Holliday <eric.holliday@alvordschools.org>
Subject: Price Sheet/Quote for 2022-2023

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Crown. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning,

Can | please get our price rates for the 2022-2023 school year contract? | am working on the board agenda for next year, and | will need to attached the rates.
Thank you,

Kristie Prady-Diaz
Assistant to the Director, Child Nutrition Services
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7377 Jurupa Ave, Riverside, CA 92504
Phone: 951-509-6200 Fax: 951-351-9269

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE: This communication and any accompanying document(s) are privileged and
confidential, and are intended for the sole use of the addressee(s). If you have received this transmission in error,
you are advised that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or the taking of any action in reliance upon it is strictly
prohibited. If you received this communication in error, please return the message via email reply and immediately
delete it from your system.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE TO RECIPIENT(S): This e-mail and any attachment(s) included herein may contain privileged and/or confidential information. This email is meant solely for the intended
recipient(s). Unauthorized review, use, duplication, disclosure or interception of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, please immediately reply to this email
and delete both this message and your reply. Please also delete any attachments on your computer(s) and/or device(s). Thank you for your assistance

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not
the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast, a leader in email security and cyber resilience. Mimecast
integrates email defenses with brand protection, security awareness training, web security, compliance and other essential capabilities. Mimecast helps protect large and small
organizations from malicious activity, human error and technology failure; and to lead the movement toward building a more resilient world. To find out more, visit our website.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE TO RECIPIENT(S): This e-mail and any attachment(s) included herein may contain privileged and/or confidential information. This email is meant solely for the intended
recipient(s). Unauthorized review, use, duplication, disclosure or interception of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, please immediately reply to this email
and delete both this message and your reply. Please also delete any attachments on your computer(s) and/or device(s). Thank you for your assistance

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE TO RECIPIENT(S): This e-mail and any attachment(s) included herein may contain privileged and/or confidential information. This email is meant solely for the intended
recipient(s). Unauthorized review, use, duplication, disclosure or interception of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, please immediately reply to this email
and delete both this message and your reply. Please also delete any attachments on your computer(s) and/or device(s). Thank you for your assistance

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not
the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast, a leader in email security and cyber resilience. Mimecast
integrates email defenses with brand protection, security awareness training, web security, compliance and other essential capabilities. Mimecast helps protect large and small
organizations from malicious activity, human error and technology failure; and to lead the movement toward building a more resilient world. To find out more, visit our website.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE TO RECIPIENT(S): This e-mail and any attachment(s) included herein may contain privileged and/or confidential information. This email is meant solely for the intended
recipient(s). Unauthorized review, use, duplication, disclosure or interception of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, please immediately reply to this email
and delete both this message and your reply. Please also delete any attachments on your computer(s) and/or device(s). Thank you for your assistance



